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Dense to very dense, brownish gray, silty fine 
SAND, moist. Some embedded gravel. 

.. (GLACIOMARINE DRIFT) 
Sampler refusal on cobble. 

.. 

Reddish brown vertical striations in sample. 
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At 1 0 feet, faint layering starts. 
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At 20 feet, possible ash layer. 
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Sample mottled reddish brown. 

.. 

Sampler refusal on cobble. 

ML Hard, brownish gray, sandy SILT with 
embedded pebbles, moist. 

SP Very dense, gray, fine to medium SAND, wet. 
ML Some fine gravel. 

lnterbeds of gray SILT. 
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SM See next page for description. 
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NOTE: This log of subsurface conditions applies only at the specified location and on the date indicated 
and therefore may not necessarily be indicative of other times and/or locations. 
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DRILLING- COMPANY: Hokkaido Drilling 
DRILLING METHOD: B-61 Mobile, 4.5" ID HSA 
SURFACE ELEVATION: 153 ± Feet 
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40- ~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~ 
Very dense, greenish gray, silty fine SAND to 
sandy SILT, moist. Some embedded gravel. 
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Water Depth At
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feet bgsWell Screened Interval:

Screen Slot Size:

Filter Pack Used:

Surface Seal:

Annular Seal:

Monument Type:

Drilling Equipment:

Drilling Co./Driller:

Sampler Type:

Hammer Type/Weight:

Total Boring Depth:

Total Well Depth:

State Well ID No.:

Notes/Comments:Well/Auger Diameter:
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B105
MW105

Seattle, Washington

700 Dexter Avenue North

8/13/12

CCC

Concrete

8/13/12

RAH

700 Dexter Property

0797-001

2179.3' east of SE corner of 700 Dexter property

36.2' south of SE corner of 700 Dexter property

140

130 to 140

0.010

Colorado Silica Sand

Flush MountBCK 018

Major Drilling/Dan

140

--

Core Barrel

LAR Sonic

2/8,6

Bentonite grout

Concrete

Concrete and brick surfacing.

Damp, dense, silty fine SAND with gravel, brown,
no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (25-60-15). Fill
material.

Damp, dense, silty fine SAND with gravel, brown,
no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (25-60-15).

Damp, dense, silty fine SAND with gravel, brown,
no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (25-60-15).

Damp, dense, silty SAND with gravel, asphalt
debris, black, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(25-60-15). Fill material.

Damp, dense, silty SAND with gravel, dark gray,
no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (25-70-5).

Damp, loose, silty SAND with gravel, brown, no
solvent or hydrocarbon odor (15-80-5). Fill
material.

Damp, loose, silty SAND with gravel, brown, no
solvent or hydrocarbon odor (15-80-5). Fill
material.

Damp, dense, SILT with gravel, dark brown, no
solvent or hydrocarbon odor (25-60-15). Fill
material.

Damp, dense, silty SAND with gravel, dark brown,
no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (25-60-15).
Brick.

Damp, dense, medium fine SAND with silt,
reddish brown, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(10-80-10). Fill material.

Damp, dense, medium fine SAND with silt and
gravel, reddish brown, no solvent or hydrocarbon
odor (10-80-10). Fill material.
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Filter Pack Used:

Surface Seal:

Annular Seal:

Monument Type:
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Drilling Co./Driller:

Sampler Type:

Hammer Type/Weight:

Total Boring Depth:

Total Well Depth:

State Well ID No.:

Notes/Comments:Well/Auger Diameter:
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B105
MW105

Seattle, Washington

700 Dexter Avenue North

8/13/12

CCC

Concrete

8/13/12

RAH

700 Dexter Property

0797-001

2179.3' east of SE corner of 700 Dexter property

36.2' south of SE corner of 700 Dexter property

140

130 to 140

0.010

Colorado Silica Sand

Flush MountBCK 018

Major Drilling/Dan

140

--

Core Barrel

LAR Sonic

2/8,6

Bentonite grout

Concrete

Damp, dense, silty SAND with gravel, trace
cobbles, brown, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(25-65-10).

Damp, dense, silty SAND with gravel, brown, no
solvent or hydrocarbon odor (25-65-10).

Damp, dense, medium fine SAND with silt and
gravel, brown, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(15-70-15).

Damp, dense, medium to fine SAND with silt and
gravel, brown, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(15-70-15).

Wet, loose, silty SAND with gravel, grayish
brown, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (20-70-
10).

Wet, loose, silty SAND with gravel, grayish
brown, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (20-70-
10).

Moist, loose, medium to fine SAND with silt and
gravel, brown, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(10-80-10).

Moist, loose, medium to fine SAND with gravel
and silt, brown, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(10-80-10).

Dry, very dense, silty fine SAND with gravel,
grayish brown, cohesive, no solvent or
hydrocarbon odor (25-60-15).

Dry, very dense, silty fine SAND with gravel,
grayish brown, cohesive, no solvent or
hydrocarbon odor (25-60-15).

Dry, very dense, silty fine SAND with gravel,
grayish brown, cohesive, no solvent or
hydrocarbon odor (35-45-20).

Dry, very dense, silty fine SAND with gravel,
grayish brown, cohesive, no solvent or
hydrocarbon odor (35-45-20).
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Total Well Depth:

State Well ID No.:
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B105
MW105

Seattle, Washington

700 Dexter Avenue North

8/13/12

CCC

Concrete

8/13/12

RAH

700 Dexter Property

0797-001

2179.3' east of SE corner of 700 Dexter property

36.2' south of SE corner of 700 Dexter property

140

130 to 140

0.010

Colorado Silica Sand

Flush MountBCK 018

Major Drilling/Dan

140

--

Core Barrel

LAR Sonic

2/8,6

Bentonite grout

Concrete

Wet, loose, silty SAND with gravel, gray, no
solvent or hydrocarbon odor (25-70-5).

Wet, loose, silty SAND with gravel, gray, no
solvent or hydrocarbon odor (25-70-5).

Moist, very loose, silty SAND with gravel,
cohesive gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(30-55-15).

Wet, loose, silty SAND with gravel, gray, no
solvent or hydrocarbon odor (35-55-10).

Wet, loose, silty SAND with gravel, gray, no
solvent or hydrocarbon odor (25-75-5).

Wet, loose, silty SAND with gravel, gray, no
solvent or hydrocarbon odor (30-60-10).

Damp, very dense, silty SAND with gravel,
cohesive dark gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon
odor (35-55-10).

Damp, very dense, silty SAND with gravel,
cohesive dark gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon
odor (35-55-10).

Moist, very dense, silty SAND with gravel and
cobbles, gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(35-60-5).

Moist, very dense, silty SAND with gravel and
cobbles, gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(35-60-5).

No recovery.
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Total Well Depth:
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B105
MW105

Seattle, Washington

700 Dexter Avenue North

8/13/12

CCC

Concrete

8/13/12

RAH

700 Dexter Property

0797-001

2179.3' east of SE corner of 700 Dexter property

36.2' south of SE corner of 700 Dexter property

140

130 to 140

0.010

Colorado Silica Sand

Flush MountBCK 018

Major Drilling/Dan

140

--

Core Barrel

LAR Sonic

2/8,6

Bentonite grout

Concrete

Moist, very dense, silty SAND with gravel, gray,
cobbles, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (40-40-
20).

Damp, very dense, silty SAND with gravel, gray,
cohesive, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (20-60-
20).

Damp, very dense, silty SAND with gravel, gray,
cohesive, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (20-60-
20).

Wet, very dense, silty SAND with gravel, gray, no
solvent or hydrocarbon odor (35-50-15).

Wet, very dense, silty SAND with gravel, gray, no
solvent or hydrocarbon odor (35-50-15).

No recovery.

Damp, very dense, silty SAND with gravel, dark
gray, cohesive, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(35-45-20).

Damp, very dense, silty SAND with gravel, dark
gray, cohesive, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(35-45-20).

Damp, very dense, silty SAND with gravel, dark
gray,  cohesive, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(35-45-20).

Damp, very dense, silty SAND with gravel, dark
gray,  cohesive, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(35-45-20).
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Seattle, Washington

700 Dexter Avenue North

8/13/12

CCC

Concrete

8/13/12

RAH

700 Dexter Property

0797-001

2179.3' east of SE corner of 700 Dexter property

36.2' south of SE corner of 700 Dexter property

140

130 to 140

0.010

Colorado Silica Sand

Flush MountBCK 018

Major Drilling/Dan

140

--

Core Barrel

LAR Sonic

2/8,6

Bentonite grout

Concrete

Damp, dense, medium to fine SAND with silt,
dark gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (5-90-
5).

Damp, very dense, silty SAND with gravel, gray,
cohesive, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (35-50-
15).

Dry, hard, SILT with fine sand and gravel,
cohesive, dark gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon
odor (55-35-10).

Dry, hard, SILT with fine sand and gravel,
cohesive, very gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon
odor (55-35-10).

Dry, hard, SILT with fine sand and gravel,
cohesive, dark gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon
odor (50-40-10).

Dry, hard, SILT with fine sand and gravel,
cohesive, dark gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon
odor (50-40-10).

Dry, hard, SILT with fine sand and gravel,
cohesive, dark gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon
odor (50-40-10).

Damp, very dense, silty GRAVEL with sand,
cohesive, dark gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon
odor (35-25-40).

Damp, very dense, silty gravellly SAND,
cohesive, dark gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon
odor (35-25-40).

Damp, very dense, silty gravellly SAND,
cohesive, dark gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon
odor (35-25-40).
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Seattle, Washington

700 Dexter Avenue North

8/13/12

CCC

Concrete

8/13/12

RAH

700 Dexter Property

0797-001

2179.3' east of SE corner of 700 Dexter property

36.2' south of SE corner of 700 Dexter property

140

130 to 140

0.010

Colorado Silica Sand

Flush MountBCK 018

Major Drilling/Dan

140

--

Core Barrel

LAR Sonic

2/8,6

Bentonite grout

Concrete

Moist, very dense, silty SAND with gravel,
cohesive, grayish brown, no solvent or
hydrocarbon odor (35-50-15).

Moist, very dense, silty SAND with gravel,
cohesive, grayish brown, no solvent or
hydrocarbon odor (35-50-15).

Moist, very dense, silty SAND with gravel,
cohesive, grayish brown, no solvent or
hydrocarbon odor (35-50-15).

Moist, very dense, silty SAND with gravel,
cohesive, grayish brown, no solvent or
hydrocarbon odor (35-50-15).

Bentonite plug.

Damp, very dense, silty SAND with gravel,
cohesive, dark gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon
odor (35-50-15).

Wet, very dense, gravelly, silty SAND, gray, no
solvent or hydrocarbon odor (35-30-40).

Damp, very dense, silty SAND with gravel,
cohesive, gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(35-45-20).
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B105
MW105

Seattle, Washington

700 Dexter Avenue North

8/13/12

CCC

Concrete

8/13/12

RAH

700 Dexter Property

0797-001

2179.3' east of SE corner of 700 Dexter property

36.2' south of SE corner of 700 Dexter property

140

130 to 140

0.010

Colorado Silica Sand

Flush MountBCK 018

Major Drilling/Dan

140

--

Core Barrel

LAR Sonic

2/8,6

Bentonite grout

Concrete

Wet, very dense, silty sandy GRAVEL, gray, no
solvent or hydrocarbon odor (30-30-40).

Wet, very dark, silty sandy GRAVEL, gray, no
solvent or hydrocarbon odor (30-30-40).

Damp, very dense, silty SAND with gravel, gray,
cohesive, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (35-50-
15).

Moist, very dense, silty medium to fine SAND and
gravel, dark gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon
odor (20-75-5).

Wet, loose, medium to fine SAND with silt and
gravel, dark brown, no solvent or hydrocarbon
odor (10-85-5).

Wet, loose, medium to fine SAND with silt, brown,
no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (10-90-0).

Wet, loose, fine SAND with silt, gray, no solvent
or hydrocarbon odor (10-90-0).
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MW105

Seattle, Washington

700 Dexter Avenue North

8/13/12

CCC

Concrete

8/13/12

RAH

700 Dexter Property

0797-001

2179.3' east of SE corner of 700 Dexter property

36.2' south of SE corner of 700 Dexter property

140

130 to 140

0.010

Colorado Silica Sand

Flush MountBCK 018

Major Drilling/Dan

140

--

Core Barrel

LAR Sonic

2/8,6

Bentonite grout

Concrete

Wet, loose, fine SAND with silt, gray, no solvent
or hydrocarbon odor (10-90-0).

Wet, loose, fine to medium SAND with silt, dark
gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (10-90-0).

Wet, loose, fine to medium SAND with silt, dark
gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (10-90-0).

Wet, loose, coarse to medium SAND with gravel
and silt, gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(10-60-30).

Wet, loose, coarse to medium SAND with gravel
and silt, gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(10-60-30).

Wet, loose, coarse to medium SAND with gravel
and silt, gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(10-60-30).

Wet, loose, medium to fine SAND with gravel and
silt, dark gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(10-80-10).
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B105
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Seattle, Washington

700 Dexter Avenue North

8/13/12

CCC

Concrete

8/13/12

RAH

700 Dexter Property

0797-001

2179.3' east of SE corner of 700 Dexter property

36.2' south of SE corner of 700 Dexter property

140

130 to 140

0.010

Colorado Silica Sand

Flush MountBCK 018

Major Drilling/Dan

140

--

Core Barrel

LAR Sonic

2/8,6

Bentonite grout

Concrete

Wet, loose, coarse to medium SAND with gravel,
dark gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (10-
65-25).

Wet, loose, coarse to medium SAND with gravel
and silt, dark gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon
odor (10-65-25).

Damp, very dense, silty SAND with gravel, dark
gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (20-55-25).

Damp, very dense, silty SAND with gravel, dark
gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (20-55-25).

Wet, loose, coarse to medium SAND with gravel
and silt, dark gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon
odor (10-70-20).

Wet, very dense, coarse to medium SAND with
gravel and silt, dark gray, no solvent or
hydrocarbon odor (10-60-30).

Wet, loose, medium to coarse SAND with gravel
and silt, dark gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon
odor (10-80-10).

Wet, loose, medium to coarse SAND with gravel
and silt, dark gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon
odor (10-80-10).

We, loose, medium to coarse SAND with gravel
and silt, dark gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon
odor (10-80-10).

Wet, loose, medium to coarse SAND with gravel
and silt, dark gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon
odor (10-80-10).

Wet, loose, medium to coarse SAND with gravel
and silt, dark gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon
odor (10-70-20).
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MW105

Seattle, Washington

700 Dexter Avenue North

8/13/12

CCC

Concrete

8/13/12

RAH

700 Dexter Property

0797-001

2179.3' east of SE corner of 700 Dexter property

36.2' south of SE corner of 700 Dexter property

140

130 to 140

0.010

Colorado Silica Sand

Flush MountBCK 018

Major Drilling/Dan

140

--

Core Barrel

LAR Sonic

2/8,6

Bentonite grout

Concrete

Wet, loose, coarse to medium SAND with gravel
and silt, gray no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(10-70-20).

Wet, loose, coarse to medium SAND with gravel
and silt, gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(10-70-20).

Dry, hard, SILT with fine sand and gravel, brown,
no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (70-20-5).

Dry, hard, SILT with fine sand, brown, no solvent
or hydrocarbon odor (70-30-0).

Boring terminated at 140 feet bgs, backfilled with
bentonite grout from 2 feet to 128 feet depth.
Two-inch-diameter well installed to a depth of 140
feet bgs, screened from 130 to 140 feet bgs, with
silica sand from 128 to 140 feet bgs, bentonite
seal from 118 to 128 feet bgs, bentonite grout
from 2 to 118 feet bgs, and finished with a flush-
mounted monument and concrete seal.
Completed as monitoring well MW105

B105-138

0.0

0.0

0.0

0.0
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SP-SM

SP-SM
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ML
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Filter Pack Used:

Surface Seal:

Annular Seal:

Monument Type:
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Total Boring Depth:

Total Well Depth:

State Well ID No.:

Notes/Comments:Well/Auger Diameter:
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B117
MW117

Seattle, WA

700 Dexter Avenue North

02/04/13

CCC

Asphalt

02/04/13

RAH

700 Dexter

0797-001

4012.6' west of power pole at SE corner of the intersection of Roy and Dexter

96' south  of power pole at SE corner of the intersection of Roy and Dexter

55

40 to 55

0.010

#2/12 Sand

Flush mountBHS 885

Cascade Drilling Co./Curtis

55.5

140

Split-spoon

HSA LAR

2/8.25

Bentonite Chips

Concrete

Damp, very dense, silty SAND with gravel, light
brown, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (30-55-
15).

Boring cleared with a vactor truck to a depth of 8'
below ground surface (bgs).

Asphalt 6" thick.

B117-100.01050/4"
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Seattle, WA

700 Dexter Avenue North

02/04/13

CCC

Asphalt

02/04/13

RAH

700 Dexter

0797-001

4012.6' west of power pole at SE corner of the intersection of Roy and Dexter

96' south  of power pole at SE corner of the intersection of Roy and Dexter

55

40 to 55

0.010

#2/12 Sand

Flush mountBHS 885

Cascade Drilling Co./Curtis

55.5

140

Split-spoon

HSA LAR

2/8.25

Bentonite Chips

Concrete

Damp, very dense, silty SAND with gravel,
cohesive, light brown, no solvent or hydrocarbon
odor (40-50-10).

Damp, very dense, medium to fine SAND with silt
and gravel, light brown, no solvent or
hydrocarbon odor (15-75-10).

Moist, very dense, silty SAND with gravel, light
brown, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (25-65-
10).
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0.0
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Seattle, WA

700 Dexter Avenue North

02/04/13

CCC

Asphalt

02/04/13

RAH

700 Dexter

0797-001

4012.6' west of power pole at SE corner of the intersection of Roy and Dexter

96' south  of power pole at SE corner of the intersection of Roy and Dexter

55

40 to 55

0.010

#2/12 Sand

Flush mountBHS 885

Cascade Drilling Co./Curtis

55.5

140

Split-spoon

HSA LAR

2/8.25

Bentonite Chips

Concrete

Wet, very dense, medium to fine SAND with silt
and gravel, gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(10-80-10).

Moist, very dense, silty SAND with gravel, gray,
no solvent or hydrocabon odor (30-60-10).

Wet, very dense, silty SAND with gravel, light
brown, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (25-60-
15).
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Seattle, WA

700 Dexter Avenue North

02/04/13

CCC

Asphalt

02/04/13

RAH

700 Dexter

0797-001

4012.6' west of power pole at SE corner of the intersection of Roy and Dexter

96' south  of power pole at SE corner of the intersection of Roy and Dexter

55

40 to 55

0.010

#2/12 Sand

Flush mountBHS 885

Cascade Drilling Co./Curtis

55.5

140

Split-spoon

HSA LAR

2/8.25

Bentonite Chips

Concrete

Boring terminated at 55.5 feet below ground
surface.  A two-inch diameter well was installed
to a depth of 55 feet bgs, screened from 40 to 55
feet bgs, and finished with a flush-mounted
monument and concrete seal.  Completed as
moniotring well MW117.

Damp, very dense, SILT with fine sand, no
solvent or hydrocarbon odor (55-45-0).

Damp, very dense, silty SAND, gray, no solvent
or hydrocarbon odor (20-80-0).

Moist, very dense, silty SAND with gravel,
cohesive, gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(45-45-10).

Wet, very dense, medium to fine sand with silt
and gravel, gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(10-80-10).
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Seattle, Washington

700 Dexter Avenue North

03/21/13

CCC

Asphalt

03/21/13

EBF

700 Dexter

0797-001-02

20On Mercer St, 76' E of NE corner of intersection with Dexter Ave N

On S property line of vacant lot in sidewalk 

50

40-50

0.010

2/12 Sand

Flush mountBIC 079

Cascade Drilling/ James

55.5

300

D+M

HSA

2

Bentonite

Cement

Moist, very dense, silty fine SAND with gravel,
increasing silt with depth, brown, no solvent or
hydrocarbon odor (35-55-10).

Moist, dense, silty fine SAND with medium-large
gravel, brown, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(30-55-15).

3 inches of asphalt.
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Seattle, Washington

700 Dexter Avenue North

03/21/13
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Asphalt

03/21/13

EBF

700 Dexter

0797-001-02

20On Mercer St, 76' E of NE corner of intersection with Dexter Ave N

On S property line of vacant lot in sidewalk 

50

40-50

0.010

2/12 Sand

Flush mountBIC 079

Cascade Drilling/ James

55.5

300

D+M

HSA

2

Bentonite

Cement

Moist, very dense, silty fine SAND with gravel,
gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (30-60-10).

Moist, very dense, fine sandy SILT, gray-brown,
no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (60-40-0).

Moist to wet, very dense, fine to medium SAND
with trace gravel and trace silt, no solvent or
hydrocarbon odor (10-85-5).

Moist, hard, fine sandy SILT, gray, no solvent or
hydrocarbon odor (80-20-0).

Moist, hard, fine sandy SILT, gray, no solvent or
hydrocarbon odor (80-20-0).

Moist, very dense, silty fine SAND with some
gravel, brown, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(25-65-10).
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Total Well Depth:

State Well ID No.:
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Seattle, Washington

700 Dexter Avenue North

03/21/13

CCC

Asphalt

03/21/13

EBF

700 Dexter

0797-001-02

20On Mercer St, 76' E of NE corner of intersection with Dexter Ave N

On S property line of vacant lot in sidewalk 

50

40-50

0.010

2/12 Sand

Flush mountBIC 079

Cascade Drilling/ James

55.5

300

D+M

HSA

2

Bentonite

Cement

Moist, very dense, silty fine SAND, gray, no
solvent or hydrocarbon odor (45-55-0).

Wet, very dense, silty fine to medium SAND with
trace fine gravel, gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon
odor (20-75-5).

Wet, very dense, silty fine to medium SAND with
trace fine gravel, gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon
odor (20-75-5).

Moist to wet, very dense, silty fine to medium
SAND with lenses of cleaner medium sand, gray,
no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (25-75-0).
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Filter Pack Used:
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Total Boring Depth:

Total Well Depth:

State Well ID No.:

Notes/Comments:Well/Auger Diameter:
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Seattle, Washington

700 Dexter Avenue North

03/21/13

CCC

Asphalt

03/21/13

EBF

700 Dexter

0797-001-02

20On Mercer St, 76' E of NE corner of intersection with Dexter Ave N

On S property line of vacant lot in sidewalk 

50

40-50

0.010

2/12 Sand

Flush mountBIC 079

Cascade Drilling/ James

55.5

300

D+M

HSA

2

Bentonite

Cement

Boring terminated at 55.5 feet below ground
surface (bgs). Boring was backfilled with
bentonite chips to 50 feet bgs.  Two-inch
diameter well installed to a depth of 50 feet bgs,
screened from 40 to 50 feet bgs, and finished
with a flush-mounted monument and concrete
seal. Completed as monitoring well MW118.

Moist, very dense, silty fine SAND with trace
gravel, gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (35-
60-5).

Moist, very dense, silty fine SAND with trace
gravel, gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (35-
60-5).

Moist to wet, very dense, silty fine SAND, gray,
no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (35-65-0). Lenses
of silty SAND present within sample (30-70-0).
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Filter Pack Used:
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Drilling Co./Driller:
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Total Boring Depth:

Total Well Depth:

State Well ID No.:

Notes/Comments:Well/Auger Diameter:
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Seattle, WA

700 Dexter Avenue North
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CCC

Concrete

03/21/13

EBF
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SW corner of intersection of Broad St and 9th Ave N
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35-45

0.010

2/12 Sand

Flush-mountBIC 080

Cascade Drilling/ James

46

300

D+M

HSA

2

Bentonite

Cement

Concrete cored prior to drilling. Concrete 4
inches thick.

Moist, dense, silty, gravelly, fine to medium
SAND, brown, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor
(15-70-15).

Moist to wet, loose, gravelly, silty, fine to medium
SAND with some coarse sand, gray-brown, no
solvent or hydrocarbon odor (15-65-20).

Moist, soft, fine sandy SILT with gravel, dark
brown, black staining, wood debris, no solvent or
hydrocarbon odor (60-30-10).
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Filter Pack Used:

Surface Seal:
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Drilling Equipment:

Drilling Co./Driller:

Sampler Type:

Hammer Type/Weight:

Total Boring Depth:

Total Well Depth:

State Well ID No.:

Notes/Comments:Well/Auger Diameter:
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Seattle, WA

700 Dexter Avenue North

03/21/13

CCC

Concrete

03/21/13

EBF

700 Dexter

0797-001-02

10

SW corner of intersection of Broad St and 9th Ave N

45

35-45

0.010

2/12 Sand

Flush-mountBIC 080

Cascade Drilling/ James

46

300

D+M

HSA

2

Bentonite

Cement

Wet, very dense, silty fine SAND with trace
gravel, blue-gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon
odor (45-50-5).

Wet, medium dense, silty fine SAND, organics,
wood debris, glass shards, gray, no solvent or
hydrocarbon odor (40-60-0).

Wet, medium dense, silty fine SAND, organics,
wood debris, glass shards, dark brown, no
solvent or hydrocarbon odor (35-50-15).
Moist, stiff, SILT with fine sand, blue-gray, no
solvent or hydrocarbon odor (90-10-0).
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SW corner of intersection of Broad St and 9th Ave N
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0.010

2/12 Sand

Flush-mountBIC 080

Cascade Drilling/ James

46

300

D+M

HSA

2

Bentonite

Cement

Moist, very dense, fine SAND with silt, gray, no
solvent or hydrocarbon odor (15-85-0).

Moist to wet, medium dense, fine SAND with silt,
gray, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (15-85-0).

Wet, medium dense, fine SAND with some silt,
brown, no solvent or hydrocarbon odor (10-90-0).
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Drilling Equipment:

Drilling Co./Driller:

Sampler Type:

Hammer Type/Weight:

Total Boring Depth:
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Seattle, WA

700 Dexter Avenue North

03/21/13

CCC

Concrete
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EBF

700 Dexter

0797-001-02
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SW corner of intersection of Broad St and 9th Ave N

45

35-45

0.010

2/12 Sand

Flush-mountBIC 080

Cascade Drilling/ James

46

300

D+M

HSA

2

Bentonite

Cement

Wet, very dense, fine to medium SAND with trace
silt, gray to brown, no solvent or hydrocarbon
odor (5-95-0).

Boring terminated at 46 feet below ground
surface (bgs). Two-inch diameter well installed to
a depth of 45 feet bgs, screened from 35 to 45
feet bgs, and finished with a flush-mounted
monument and concrete seal. Completed as
monitoring well MW119.
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