
From: Tietjen, Matthew (ECY)
To: Mandy Duval
Cc: Moen, Kamren (ECY); Garbush, Gayle (ECY)
Subject: RE: Ecology - FY25 Water Quality Semi-Annual Invoice: Permit Number WA0000361
Date: Tuesday, October 15, 2024 10:40:19 AM
Attachments: image001.png

Hello Mandy,
 
If Safe Coast’s permit is reissued before July 1, 2025 with a new fee category, Ecology
will update Safe Coast’s FY25 invoice to reflect an updated amount due based on the
new fee category, and the effective date of the reissued permit.
 
As a quick example, if Safe Coast’s permit is reissued with an effective date of February
15, 2025, a new invoice would be issued with a balance due that reflects Safe Coast’s
current permit fee from July 1, 2024 – February 14, 2025, and the new fee rate from
February 15, 2025 – June 30, 2025.
 
Until an updated permit is in effect, the balance on Safe Coast’s FY25 invoice will reflect
their current fee rate from July 1, 2024 – June 30, 2025.
 
Matthew Tietjen v He / Him
Water Quality Permit Fee Administrator
Fee Unit v Water Quality Program
Email: wqfeeunit@ecy.wa.gov
Cell: (360) 280-3697

 
 
 
 
From: Mandy Duval <mandyd@safecoastseafoods.com> 
Sent: Friday, October 11, 2024 1:21 PM
To: Tietjen, Matthew (ECY) <mtie461@ECY.WA.GOV>
Subject: RE: Ecology - FY25 Water Quality Semi-Annual Invoice: Permit Number WA0000361
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Caution: Please note that this email was sent from an external email address. We
kindly request that you exercise caution when clicking on links or opening
attachments. If you are uncertain about any content, please reach out to either
Michael or the IT department for assistance.

Hi Matthew,
I started filling out the form for the economic hardship but with the other products on our
wastewater agreement we are over the threshold.  The problem is we had no surimi sales at
all.  We had sales of the other products but the surimi processing is what made as have to
have the DAF and the DAF maximum output is what was putting us in the highest category.
Without that we would have been able to be in a more affordable category.  What can I do? 
Now we have received our invoice for FY2025.  Would Ecology be able to adjust down our
newest invoice once our new application is accepted.  I think we are going to fit in the second
to lowest category.  We actually fit in the lowest but we might process crab for the Canadian
crab season too and that might make us go over a little bit so my company wants to play it safe
just in case.
Thanks,
Mandy
 
From: Tietjen, Matthew (ECY) <mtie461@ECY.WA.GOV> 
Sent: Wednesday, October 9, 2024 9:11 AM
To: Kiet Lam <kietl@safecoastseafoods.com>
Cc: Max Boland <maxb@safecoastseafoods.com>; Mandy Duval
<mandyd@safecoastseafoods.com>; Garbush, Gayle (ECY) <ggar461@ECY.WA.GOV>; Moen,
Kamren (ECY) <kmoe461@ECY.WA.GOV>
Subject: Ecology - FY25 Water Quality Semi-Annual Invoice: Permit Number WA0000361

 

 
Hello,
 
Attached is Safe Coast Seafoods Washington’s FY25 semi-annual invoice for permit
number WA0000361. I have also attached past due invoices for outstanding balances on
this permit from FY22, FY23, and FY24.
 
Please confirm receipt of these invoices. Thank you.
 
Matthew Tietjen v He / Him
Water Quality Permit Fee Administrator
Fee Unit v Water Quality Program
Email: wqfeeunit@ecy.wa.gov
Cell: (360) 280-3697
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This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended
recipient(s) and may contain information that is confidential and proprietary information
of SafeCoast SeaFoods and protected by law from unauthorized disclosure. Any
unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the
intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of
the original message. Thank you!


